
eed 	Vo to - 4 

ffqip PT , 3. ?" -371? 

sffiNITW 

979'T, q-‘ 71'fa-g1.7, 20 Rt 1976 

itrq 30, 1898 ITT ffPra, 

397 51;hr TCTIt 

faer 99)-TriT-1 

!srk4T  
ft.kstr 

tPatii 2399117 fr-1--82-76 

cvq,-td, 20 Tit, 1976 

estfLam 

fif-ar 

lima' TT egaiw 9th 200 i9Ott9" TI\T-TT19" OPT •A‘ 2'7T sair faffm TragT a-ru =miff • 
3W 	j 1141 TT (*ft-4 9trc t'stIrcqr) fAi7F, 1976 crt fkwiT 19 fft, 1976 toer 11ffFTC9' 
%)" VIT 7g 8n 	t srt4T TrfafitriT ..i0.24(23, j 7 jq 	i-Fran-Tit *'1 flT*V 	ramr,Trzt 
wri9T7 N-9-r 	A: 

sr=47 fat-n (4erntrffTr17 44-1-m-Kur) grfir rigfi, 1976 
	sr3/474 Trfaf49-4 41rir 23, 1976) 

(4ffr if reT Aka Nam von un' q,fta* cam i) 
‘dri kr/bi-  FIA-TT qq?, 1948 kV wicrt4tri-9"  

cf4MatiTt 

wr-(-7ivj 	tIvtl % fmt(-44 Ter if f9T-49Thru.  Olean 4-9-rsrr A 	 t:- 

1- -q.."  TA IT 797 n41* fdThnifT (thitari 9AtT iaT)*TTTT ) ITfiekTIT, 1976 
alTi I 

2--317 	ra-*T kIT, 1948 t 0 (fAt Tait 97 32firt-971T 	rya t) +1.  
arKT 3—W IT, 	( 1) % f41-6" fii-11-4N4 81tITTT TOft Wftlit9;14-16::-- 

" (1) EITTT 3-W% Tr ETTTT3-711: 4Fr 3:177q12'Teraff a. Tel* iffvEr, rff 
71'0'744 q 	f*Err ;give IRT kr; 

(w)*it -Ya-9. 	w9179.-47 zrr 	wrIT 4a-k srr cm-Yr-94
•

+-1.  
0141t<i' 41

• 	
T TF4)7 ler sitto ccr-cr 97Til zit 	97NTI % iTr4;ti 

	

,h9-17f TT, kifr q'T 77, w'r ar4-1-4 srfAirirfmn. 	fkk Trur 
	 flARTra-rcr Enfsra- 	9-IrrErr wrsprr; At 

ealci MIT 

397 sthr 
ft6TIT 15,1948 

3-e7 
#9frEr9- 



2 	 51t7T mt1a.11714 TrWa, 20 Tit 1976 

am 3-TT 
Offta4 

Ern 3-5 TT 
ragT9 

WM 3-w TT 
Itletrff 

(N.  ) 744 	frd'ar T4T4 4 fafri q,d 4T4 t14-14T fatc- 
TR:, 7w1t to 4-4 3 ift ft" fri 14tr.: Tzr9' tr<, ThEFT 	trt, 	c177 eff7Ta' 

4 Trfarf.  tt, 	7113Zi tl111 1,4.1117 tigi Enfcrff 	zrziT z-91441- 
irtt .:}471 W1741 ft fwfrnr AMT. 4 4.4ifqtd IT-a-f4-q-  41.4 tuctra 
f4-7-f4--a Te:  T't E117717 71. 	jr t 

51.f4wg 7 ft fT 774 Fr-c-orz, f7-17 m,sr44 Tr9orafWtza4 
.f4Ta.  *If Afafre f9-r4 ;rpr.cil t 5717 717 ATT7 f4-41-* Irt fwth 

'gf-a-fre T9.  rift a--(7 tfrea., 7.73. 	ci "TIT 	 fi3fr AfecT f4F-44 ZIT 
7479., Va W-t 	C!, 	tit fq-e7 	4:ATEr' 71-4 	799" 	4,:re.411 
( 3) 	0,0 i‘ ver9.  74 F, 7[9.4 R ;Fitt FIR* wrtrf. r I" 

3-117 TrfaMmT 41' WITT 3-ET 	3751ITT ( 1) zit  7q:;TT7 titcr wt 
tritsjictid q) 	FETtaTVIT 1' TT f1/471 trr,cic441ry ffiI 	eitkeTT117 2 
gt,•fqqi 717T TIN 4-4w 4r7TIT7T 9f9Tell tti 	f, 9217t;:-- 

_ 
taT717 2--76.  c SITTT iA7179Tit, MATZ* 9-f% VuTfrzTIT, 1955 

rTT 3* 1:141.7qifdr-7 7tru 	t cl" fkgzerfter TT 	it37T Wc7IT, 1971 
F7:711 114 	U'ltff1RT 	WIIifl971T 

4, en 	a 7,77 ti 4 OliTT Tit W4 $414t17197 Trat tqq zfT •tic; W7- 
Tifilrlf 4 tn.  Eq 	14 1 a TM fT77 777 31.44 	‘4• €11-C17 .T1 Trzfli 	ePTT, 
etT.15.1.4T7 	zwzrzt 7T TET EfT cIT TT 91TT7T ,311 44 417 I" 

4-449.  vnit.474  T'r .sirr 	To-4 oi ITT 1-14-494127 S4 	 witq'Tzfth, 	 
	 4 	711 FRI 	*if 71.411-1, vAztiq.-- 

" 	ziwki 	 .11) 21 7f, 1974 Ti 71.  WFIT I-191 	f=r,t; Tfritd‘ 
Etttcrrft 4 ,84 trf-6Eziftlf 	f-A4( 	Fx4 I • 	Ttr 

wfa.7 4vitiqc-(-17T 	• 
7544.,*( 	1,4 t 	Tt& TT 44 7 	 &acair 4-  ft-  fwer 

rf.W.7 Tit T7-7-#7 1:11.9. 	;:1 q71 rti  91 	k'4 41.4 
w-fu 7tr-4,F1.  77, z-Ffr rcr-c, fr-r4 TT T14-  41'4 e.; fewq-4Ftc.  
77 TT 	@'91.  zir7 7:11`tr9f1219 crftfc-trf44t fawn tth, TR TT 	: 

	

Et4 .1-4 -7 PI  fT   .* T77 T kl9" ITT TT 'ttr 9;11T 7ft• 

k‘71  VT7Tft TT fet.410., 7f4TT7-1 79-t71771.7 7 7T177 TT k 
TIT7 47 TT r;3.  4fvf-ick 	f-77,1t 	 74 t 	7TT 77.  
9-4TT7T 7T7i4TT th 	EMT VafT7 Tit TTjaiiiiT: 

srf4.-474 	(4t1 t 	ZA k"4.  4r4 TT WC (r.9.11 	fl Tit, 1975 -i- 
atgaa-1gf4-e;srrr4-47€fT -Tt 	374-9-4iiza 717:417 	'9M• 'TT-W7• 52ferzi•  
fwt ;;Fq -Tcp7T.-.1 Trire crvq1a: vFm7 "7T c;rZti fq7N4-17. giflf474, 1956: .  

7EFFi" 	f7+1 Tre ft.  I" 

Trt-e9IpT Tet ITV 3-we, vire "STiffn TT re'  T 	W.( f9.;9P- 
fRfqf9' 	c9iT 	feR fkt'T 1 W7, 1975k? T7114717 tiit( TIFITT, 5Siti 

f igrfffn 7 ft fw.  4Tra w't Tut fw4nr. 	Etrrtrit Tr-cr e 92-fattor  
Q.  et, fm 	ti 	fttrfa., w-c ezrt-kwr-Er9 ZTI 'TzT-E19' zit it9ti 171zilz1 

I 	tar ai e4 m-Ki! Ttrit irfETT t, ert4srfairra. erft: 

iniTK srfocspu 9 

6—R9 vfErfilti w't ErR.T 3-U 4, ‘s Lit! I +.1 ( 2) 3;17 Virg "71 A iltf7ATPT,. 

TT7th tthiTi 71.  ,i.-11)4{Wr 	1717f9-4 77 9;rfacar9- 4-5-csitj fr.-777 	TriTJT I . 

• 
7—z7 diNc-itief 	EMT 4 4, catz (c) 	Rt717 cr( f9-49ThikTra- 	7ta.  feta 

warm aft< t-47TT 2 Tit, 1974 k? ImT1TrTrr, aTzna::— 

(T ) m4t,i,'vitt,wiI-tucw,41,6 	 lire< fFsra, two.; djI 3/4 	 FITT 

dimq;k7) f7.'r TcItlitt a1itTf9117, 1939 4 =Nu-4km 	Acr 4tr< ftx, 
w 3th arcritO Zit fat 374 ;FM Tct fWa an 9-fmcx , t-Wk•Krzr kicevi c. 

feecu grcr 	e; trr " 

Er 171.  3-3 TT 
#efti7 

VITT! 4 TT 
ffk-fTET7 



3:7“1; 	it( -737777777F, 2 0 Tit 1976 

7171:-N 4-1 	ETRT 	ITIL- 

( 1) 377PJ (1) * 	(T ) 4, *T67 -0-‹ at* "7ft 47F 3 	3T7fT7 T7- 
tit77 Tit TIM NIT 44244[41a nu Kgficr aT7r 77-7 7m* les:-  , crrftzriu, 
aerT# TT1 777 T7f * 177-717 77 T7 TT .14i 	 cr< qizzdfl. 
"eq. 7T7T 3-7 *1 7iti 4 	 ( 	31-47 	'‘11 717. 170 44.-  04141U 
nu Trkt4-r 71-r7 	717-r* art7, 772-1-{-717, 77 7r 777 77 77-77 cr< 
7rz 7-TT 	er 	TTT-7 ,:t;) 777-: 1777ft cti 	.<;1.  WM 77 kl 	Ft1e4t4I RttZT 
wrzr 1774 4-0 4•77717).  7r-k-r7-7tr7 .3-7* 7T-F-0-7 	7-7-77 7-1 	t 

f-aI aft< fcri 	it 214 1 974 if 77 414EifT 7i1ith ; 

71;7M (1 ) * •Tr7  (7) 4, 7E7  "F*0 27-7 Erm atsfr7" * 
7-t 7E7 "‘-.7 71711431 *14,41 41••-ci ,,•41,t1 * aitff" 74. ft4 ,4111.11-  717. 170*• 
21 if, 1 974 4W 74 	7:1 4-Lir '!H, TIT 

377M (4) * 717 (1) * 77-tan (TT) 	T77, TzfeZT. arrt sTT 
"3717R7 (3) *1  77117" * T777 7T 7177, al77 afrt 777 "7117T 9-7 * TEN" 
-77 fa 704 75117 IT7TW 1 77i, 1 973 4 *. 74 	7-11-44 

7T7 4-7 TT 
TR7477 

1TM 8-T TT 
Tt7777 

71-71777 7177 8-T 4,377171. (1_7) 	7TI (Tr ) 4(14. (7 ) T777 
;77 f;14-rifT1-77 777 77 fel ‘311;2(;1 7171c 	1*, I &Tem, 1976 i3 7,* 74 3711 7T44, 

"(TT) -ciTn- t*vir *12-2if 	 ti+cir4 	“41411 ai kr 77-P3 
414 	7,2-7 .t7 	ski* q4. 	-f-77-177 rot 7T tkpi-,' 77r 4174, fAtt.i7 
CIRRI 77177T cpTm  7T7T 7-4-4t7 774 7tr %cc!, 4'7 trr 

(7) *IT 7177, 771-17717, R-12 	 7-77 TIT 7-41--777* WI 177 	707* 
4r7--{ 7710-c17 I T3-4, 7M. 14 TIT 7M: 15-wcr-vit 7-<sIfck, n77-4 
Tr4 17-7r, 334-F477 	* 7171777 7c--7-* 	tri 74-7* 7T7 	 'I  

-17771' 74-47, 77T 7%, 2 5q4  TT 371T-7a 477 elliT 

0--71. 717-7117717 T1 7M 8-7 4, 7,72Tru (2) * 7117 77 14-1 c-) 	(1(1 3rfErra 
Tw 7T ,,,rgtvit 3T17 17717i aer€5, 1976. W. 777'r 7* ti+0.11 colt, 

( 2) 77fT377 71;1'41 <II tut * fez? 7Tif7T-77 1771177 75:67 4- 	%TIT 
	 3ft7 77* 777 777 *-<-17-7177 74 7T ,,t,*mu * Per, fAti; 	 

. 	177r Tr7r e, 7777 7reir, 417 7247 9771 77477frr act 7r t,t1; 7T7 * 
. 1,7.24 177T-7;17177 	&Tr 	77417C 794 77T 5:17* ,0161,-t 77--(-4 77T 

77-* 707 q't7-r I" 

11--74  7171,-N4T*1 Erm 11 4, 7,11N 	( 1)4, 77T4 	k A-77 "ioo 7ev * r--7F 
,cr! 7B7 "t ft 	" w ft* 7T44 

717T 9-7 Tr 
77-T77 

717T 11 TT 
ti7itirf 

12--1377 	6114 riu+ITI CIRI 32* T7T7 	ifrT1 71c-, tc4 Ermr 77.7 

" 32 	( 1) 377R7 ( 3)* ztra-c-Elf* 3:19717 TS.  E7, trm 9* 7743 aitirei 
WIT:r4 	rr7 wT7-77 717 TrrErf-Fzrff 	aitriff wrgr 777777-trdt1 77 

4 v,r,T7 	47 777 FKRIF5fin FartirT :-- 

(T) WM 9 * 5reft9. 	14,41v177 T7, 7T--* M slitg 	EPT- 
31-1171 71111-77 77 • 	i RTT 74 xf-o7r-7, 17-1 

ttiqi 3(7.717* 4 717Tit 0 crar7 777-T 

	

filsc2“,-7 wz,.777Zn 3174-7iZ 	Errikir7 
*T 01 Fru 7177a-, foti  

	

Wil 3f.17 v`7* 4 717* - 71-7 	-TTErr 

(7) ETRT 10 * 77749' 
77-tr'er7 	ft•-a str471T-7-7 

t 77, tT  trr arzt-717.  
*17ri7-1- 	. tv-4,11 
7p40-77 7 it 

(7) 7ru 35ca -5flp.f çrq tg 7 

7177 32 TT 
Titt77 



4 	 797 AbT WITNIWINte, 20 qt, 1976 

9teli 	 35 TT 
dITAT 717-Tt 	Erta::-- 

"35-- ( 1 ) Afd FATAT9W if4413;td4T ART 7U1 21 jdElttd T7-f91TITT.  
lc; EVA Taw AVdY 	9;ifEl7rer ITTRi fdITTIdtd +744 	er 4 t4tLigi WIt 51F:' 
aawrisa 	 a-Ka 	fTqfl ifMfdf974 % srEera9r4,--... 

(w) 	1fUfUT safaat 	#E1, 	197, T4, FT49ct,'. 
f974, Uti,h0 qr1TTTTft fr4TIT agn-re ; 

fwact Err ai srfafwar war w)--1 wri-ft f zrr altarnTa: 

gr-9V e #9-79- fr IiifY; UT ; 

) 	T' AT 4.T 51-0 MT NAT 7TAITT, d'rE 7fT ATI Tit TETTY d(dT4 , 
dTMd ft ftd A fat e gur v- UT 517197-Ad 9:9"rff ITAT 

srfaaTwr tfw att 4'4 VT T1 STri 	trtir am.? 4 3;rfawrtt 
wrta#imi W111i,ErarftErfa, arcr-sra Err Ar49T-Td 	- 

;Errara-zr rata. zrr Tnw7 w-( Er-war t 

( 3) ffaferaqktati ;Vert aisw -arra tisrr— 

(w) faal-r frn UT ff fvfaaw ATTaft9.  awrir 
;rata faEr,aa fwer ara srfawrir ar arfawrt 	am' fwar 

car sr/far-Era; srfir 

	

(ar ) Qr wrztar-cra.  ti 	d'ff fraa-r whit 	t, it< 	ti 	 fwFft 

	

fq-r9-ktd. 99114 WY AldidT 	;Tt ef I" 

13--TT," dfdfdAlT T1.  =MT 34 	TddTa: fdT-49-Riff STrr 	del' 	, 

Errw fawfa, ufr aria e werhyrc 4; a! 

(a)  4)1 #E4a-tr7 fawa Err wa srtc afa 	3F(Wr fqTA 
117 , ZIA Iftqfff TCri ; riT 

(Er) fw41-Earartr-fasig Tri 	tl'IwTtrr T-t-r97 	awri aal-wra 
fail Nagar-7a jar srifara t ; Err 

(at) fwwItawErarwEr-fairai.  ErEaraq tJfk e, 
zirer a-c wzr t; 

er ftdfsru zthTarr AT7Tef, URI 32 if fafafas-e 	dTTNI 	<4;, Rarer 	-; 
Wifaefzu 	ata, fainrwa wfEraa.cw").  ariar-aa Erwar t 

WI 	Tf44-07, strzff 	fiddi TT Al 	t 44 Erma:, 	ATTT 
.7eTW AVd iffr at 7faw awe, fafaflaw wbrr : 

sr fd clrEl 9 t tfrr fafaaaa 44 acg fa-361-w7 wfwaa-c a-faiwra‘firt 
sr* asaYafa afirwrir@ritata wt4if99ffrn kfait at ?fr aaai 
fafitota i fair dT4 	vg ww4t I 

fliErm W 9704 frkwa wfaawa fafavaa fwer T'T fatfrtw Ore:,  
wrer, 	cf.  9'9.4 IT% dfdTit 	;i4fuT975.171-{t 	94" ref ire fcfri 
Raw 	fafic•I 	rill I ZIT 	sra4a Er< Mt sraTa 	rritFri I 

TIt 	wilrfkiTri wrta fww-r srrftrwrit am writ i ErraR fife 
7TAM" Z-era' tr, 	ETRI 	ti bi tur Itq wer 	fol 

WTAITT I 

(Er) fat argr araar-aa 

) 	q714.4;TTT Tfififf-c Err a-t-•4aur 	era aaErr 
afawrer AT fT6.1.  3Tfrfi TA? TTM-ToT afferTI 

4Eatfaa tr 

(2),3-ia fwer WEI alf7W17)" AT ATIATIft 	LI 
TT F17(1fq•a- 

(2) tif ETC 4 A17r ifdfdATT AT life ded 11141' lie 197nti 
tWt5znr zaawa Matz arAaw a:al 

(w) 377 akar eifwer 9ar4 ar usr-arar4 Err F4z a'w WIT tfaza 
fTift FRITT WITT 4, (.1.) fWAT drA1TT, 	g44IT TN7TR % dT7Td4t 

77 Afd, fdITTY Ref4.1.ff Wc.c7T T1' 74T EfT(T5T fart at tr, urcr-tra' 



WU4IWEIMITT7 Tfre, 20 Tit 1976 

( s) scif Eirc t multi 	 fkAtirt 	 kfrfi w4 
CaillaffIr 	jtftpj 3;ffilrg7q.a fl,417-47  Orr 

( 6) M u 	rE1trf 	ftf i itqf 7Isrfff5rTe 417 4;44 47-fill- 
vfig4ta 1141' s" 

srerff 9r4t 
fieln 

14-.-119" 	 C'eTIT 	 

( 1) *A-l.  26, 32,39, 62 Ai 	t 112* am44- -1•54tiftelM1 	I994 

	

fri,-.11<iflgo srfali444i.  vt 	,srP-7411, 4g-ft :-- 

-474-41T 	 Tir9" *1.  f11 	tat 	 W9' 144 qT 	affr 

2 
	

3 

26 	cl WM, 	.RN 4.1"4: ThrT *WI ii71:79"* 14o 4441-  WT 0 
7 	•f974- 9-4ft 	t kik4TeiFIC .cr4 WiTaq 71-Wift, 

414;4, ; trd");1,,i q. 4F, Ecy4TE,2;.5 CITET 	m rm 
c561413;1"177 TIT-PT ffizzlika.  ff.@ t 

32 	tHitci 11,31c11*1-F11.131.9',#q, ctti I-, tar, 411cird M 4, 4i 4t€C1 (igt frO .m.l.gr 5;IT 0 

TfTit 	cti ant fay-  vifkg fair 	tt 444r t 
VIC ft9; M.045 	mfoql 	ca.  Za4 (144i qrwerg 

c; rd.! j. 414.7 F+741-EM-T, fc5itod Tisr-{ ti 4,4 4 Trmr9-  11'1- 
g),   	4-WIR4 	9. 1l- 4q 
9..1.11..1.9' /At utotr WTI  
4rt  	Iqqd wf1/24- 	 41-.K 
crritm *' 	;ft'failq,R4) wnr th,41, 
ki 	s-rzci42  fttt*ZT 	.:5+1; Tarr, aTtn4t, 

4T-47 	49.  4777t 	ftFAIIFE 	"c,"tffr- 

	

t 	. 	• 	 • 

39 	Wi'W*44.  timtc-f1:11;119" / 	W49", frr .  riat; 	;TM' 	fff 0 31"41-41.  Trr 

qf c69T, -44-f.  efir, tei-4 914i-4 tr 144-0-11, 
- 4)44 ,A1..• viter, wr4t 	 (ityr) , Pr.ffrir4 
1-9174,i4t  	4:4 wr144 #4 417 
,i44)(ui kffrif1ur4 	•t- 

62 	(4) zita-T - 4TT 

litZTzftt *FT 	fn* Miti477.9**315i• 'Alt 	744 
Sift:J:111i 44kt7Ttrir 

(TT) kit tr rif f 	 1,1 	-‘?.. 4i 4fknrtt  
417 3;ri4T- 	irtt in it(f;   
.i'Akt WTT-At t Efl tt), j 4-  4144 ITT 

4-4 tTI4ic1i4 I 

112 	(w) s crn trriTTru Trici, .(14.1) tcrt3AT 	WPT Fff c441 io 
T4T m1-14 9T41Th 147 -2.751-4:1#tf0-5 fr7:7 FtnrIETa.  

• 

(q) ja444- 11-E 

7scrlf44r tr4f4N1' 
3;17-4 u,n-fm-r TrKT 

* 	fg4 
"oziqozif 
Watcivi 4,1-4,41 

f41,1 

(‘) 

gig 

Th.0 34%Tql.  VT 0 



775-(7;7:31- writaw.ilwe.„ 2 0 .7t,1 976 

cltiq 
ftEr9' 

( 2).  TR.  -7111iT, 8 9 't 111:74tc1 	2t tffRcEi 	T-974Th-fist W f'779T 
qT4TIT 417 f1/4917 

 
2r1, 19 74 4 WT Wqr 	7T3.011, 

. 	"9-4T 7-4;77. 7.-tit 	ft4e-,447R79', 	 5a7.71-q-9.91TH-fu.  
7f7. 1-q crfrati:in.  97.11 	fAqli Fftto 	ift-67 fta, 

721,T71 41-.77 ata  	 1939 	72:1Thrthrffifq-U 
5,Tirlft,7:4.-1.  ;Tel 

is-- 	kr "F''t.  T7 iti‘19", 1 948 f, 0 4,-- 

( 	) friJA 4i 1 2-T 4, 7-,4777 ( 4) T P:117 	fri 	IFfkl7 	rcei 71W, 
TRIM,  :— 

" 4) Tki: 71ZT 	9-q 	rTITE fq:41-  tiritTir 	fE.1041  
gl7T 25 WT-79rt Thct 	 3 75 wit Ti7 eff w7r-qq.*‘ N-4 

5 ef.4 w."1 7.7 37-4-.' 	-4-77.77 	TRTT t I"  a 

( 2) 1747 1 2-W Tr, TT mtnT (a) 	tr.fT9' 97 19-c9191-q7 	fq97 
srgirr, wrzfrg,:-- 

" ( 3) Tlt 1117I cf-77' 	77 7TO 70:  fW4T 717117 74 7'W' fq 
Egtcfre gra 50 T11-77I Wi gig TRUTT T.  Id 7 . 50 444 41 gra.  

11-117'T 177 is r14.t 	 ‘7717 WK f7117 77T 01 I"; 

(a) f771i 19 T 7117 (w) 	zzig "IFRTTe 14714 4w191'4 € Writa" 
1-77T7 144 ,4144, 

1977 20-7, 4-- 

(T) VTR' '7714 Rfl qiTT 	Tc1T9-  410711 	crt 7741117 ITITTT 
jtse 3L17gi wife ; scr 

) ups() 7E7 "7714 TT 71717 	T W17 77 7E7' 
4,71 7717 0111" '‘'71 fgrl 7T4-4 

1977 25-W 4,-- 

(7 )4  771777 ( 3 ) 	TN fffr9frifwu R'gr iggr 7177T 	f1/4fftw 
ws 7, 1976 33' .t1511 TrEfT 4777 7147T, S1717,  : 

" ( 3) 741747 ( ) sra19.  liTnIST TT 71TruT-7-7 717ri fWiT 
TIT4 •T%  f94 sz4 7.6 gT4 FIT-74 T kTT4171 4.  5 0 474 TT 79T 4'4 071; 
417 IT ei-* TT_F9trivii W ZTT77•T‘ TUT T 	fn? f4147 FrffIST 
Wi94T0'517T4-11 R, 25474 WT 111,77 7‘4 7-14TT I"; 

(7) 7'11777 ( 5 ) 4', 	wit Fr; fa-Km 	cr• wrr,fffff-aff 
f741 71'471 it 	91/ 	(cc 1-9-Ziff7111i7 411 fggr 711171i 

"717 77 	 iT, 1,144.1-  aq 7171 (TETT 717, WI' 
10110 7171 I 4f4 ETITTra 77,71 97.1:tival 77171' 17:71 t 	4-4 
77T 1' 	7 'fru 	 Tat 	( ) 	R;r9yrK grim-tra 
7‘7-Tii111 fq..T1 717 7747 	 ( 3 ) iggifo• sacyq 	f..:T TT . 
7714747 4ITTTIT 071 I 7f4 frit 77, 417717-1 TT 771'417 
71.4 41477-97 17'77 I 't 1117 t 717 svw 7ITT 771741 771 et gt ; 
7T 417 41 017 ati 4 sr-i 	raw 14 	fwet, 44).  gg-tw -ar Yrr4m- 
sg 	tsfqo 	rug t, 77TuT-74 TT 94ITVIT 4i‘71 I"; 

(7) 77 1-77 41 ( 1 1  ) wsg 	7'T "5 774" T WIT 117 7E4 90t 
" 10 474" 77' fti sae ; 

	

(€) 1777 25-'4 4,77 f4g4 ( 2) TWIT 9-1 17791-71714 	fsgT 71741; 

	

"(2) it 34177-1, NWT 717 7TT417T TT 7177-77 	,A1-< t Er RI 
4-7 0.  CfcroTTTT ( 1 ) e €rn (gr ) fest?. ftz4 	40 g9T 7Trist tr, 7ET 

ig5-T7-.9zfamIt *1, fw4i' Qaffswr7* 4taz 	a; zgrzert5T
• 	

iwr nffff ; 
fflts gi-T, 'SITU TT 714T TIN 71'ef 	fki CfriffT-W RITT I 17-41- 

714Wit TI.RT 7147T TT 11141 TM 	7'T 77ti 40 fist '414411 



'ii - iicT , 20 142 1976 
417 

fT Tki 25441'1 Tel fff PUTT f74-  3.75 WI 41.  51iff511-g 41' 

f9.4 15ci T1 TT 4 7,77q TT 11;kari TT17M writ I 7491-44 TT 

fa.zFr 25.,‘9 	fkTIT (•1 ) 7.--ififff;sa• WI-  797 E9f7rw gra ratcl 
IT-4r .71-47rr I"; • 

(7) .fw-417 414, uctfa.9-4 (1) 4 fi4i 	WET 6' frzraZT STfaAnTTUTT) ;VIZ TIT 

fqzu wr47rt, fl.— 

"iTiRTsrfa-wa trk 	zrziter fT977-tra sriv9;74i 	TZT czlicfra; 

5-T04qc.i al* W gqi fig 	tut cra itcacto faTzt Erw*' 57t977 773-fr aisf 

	

wtfaw7r sta.  7(‘Ttrfa-w   \iv R14 - ft tTeritit ,;ITTiqff TT 

9v-wr s17 s 	fa-mir Rim R79' suit'w trur 4 	am*" 
4nt 	W2T4T EH 	tip( Till 	tt ono T a, MIT 5191/41-tfrd fffirre ifw4 419.1 
1,14. -qa.  tr  ww7tr-fwznt 4 argfttia.  tiff 4 #ZITT it REV &NT 

414711, TtO fizr-ai kTi TT TT ;Tqftls?.. MITT WIT TT TITIT ci;  

(8) iffzriT 46-T4k, 	/414, 7at " 1 0 25 44" t 	;TT 7.Faq 

f75I 

( 9) fa-7446-77 	7.1z7 q-1-Kg# "1 .6. o" 7'79' kT TSTk 	 &+.1 fqk 

v-44; 

(1o) f7p7a.  54 4 7.7f,149 (2) @-orr TT fr.,  74-7a-  WT 5rPW1, 

" ( 2) 5RITT M149T-TTd" 	kalf911"; f4f9M3E 	#17. qaf- 
7,77, qwt:.  i 	t, qn.1 TT,k TT TIVT9'41,1t. AkTuT eTITT I" ; 

( 11) f9-24"k 58 4, 7:3111ce-Riti ( 1) if, r4T;P4.  1-11 	4.b "417. Ti‘q i; 	tr-7 V9Tff 

4'1'1  fle,T, fit tl 	raff 	fT 10 7. 0 TT qleti ;q7-1.4 .4 4 ,74T TT ['Val 72-41.  t" 

't1i T io "3 1P:. 	q11-1  TTk r9.Tiitt4,-It 1-71Ttri irm-  T.7 frit writ4; 

(12) fwarn.  61 4 7r,g 	"NT* 91-zr 	‘1-4T7 73.  Tiff TT 

4qr 	fT %Tit 7a7.q 42 7E-4 TT 4,1c,* 4-TRT ct-TT ftq'T TF: T. t" 	T4Iti TT. 

Wt-7-4 941-T, sifTh-rti2,  92110 F.0 TT 91 -7-gT TTFT TT kthcf-497 5PTIuT OTT" 

Taz 17-4 w 

(is) fro, o 	f9tj27:7 1797 -,777.77r2; 

(14) Vv., 	a 7o 4, 72tf7r74 (2)4, 7777,91-•7 5.4w "1 fli) 25 ,14";-  T-ITT9 TT 

4I01 	vi4" W fd-  wPitr ; 

s) frf 	 77-9. 	 - 

(T ) TT-1ry-4a (I) 4, L277 vw7.---717r wit it" .a 712a.  rt7. 7we; "`qT 
727cf-7at 	4.4; qrt- 

(7g ) TT-frikk (3)4, W ".7grar 9-4 ,114" ?:-9m 77.177.7 "rlyn k924" 

77-4 f7.-.4 v44 ; • 

(16) Frolo 85 	f 	( 3) 	T 4 	fa791,1 <z-f 734 Ati I TT -TFIT; 

s-- 

" ( 3) WITT 57-Wit 7.p:2 a7rk '5772 Etlaurt-79-  cw7 	wit all 
fw.97 7117TT7 TT f-LiTCTIT `4 	 f *q4r 5o5poi-i nrcwr. ,{1-a-cur 

kg 7.5O Ili qTft41 rqIti 1711491- 
T1 TT friti 4I 54 T4IT f9TTIT ( 1) 4 4c:ci 	Pac. v71 	4 4 II-417w 77141 
rtTf77-tcTw1fd 	c4INTT 74-1-TT. 	ITTt w174 I " 

( 1 7 )fr-111;1 8 ; TT f9 	 ( 3) 	77. fri 4411,11w PCIT 	 

" ( 3) TTf. MT 131-97 TT TT 	I wr7a7 n..ww fT 5114 -Pi 71"-'1V 
41,t 	49:7. 	tiirw Taz fr)72 WM I" 



VW.< 	3111ThiRoi 	g o Trf i 976 

err fait ucf6. 
	 . , 

1) , 	f9ttiiu 	Wm' .66 Val 	TT. TOT =tit; Trwzr 
1stkl'iT4 	 tirrE. 	tt Tit ti 	 Tha fricsw 170e10-2-6923(a23-1012-1972;  41iftn 	f-47i7 I fec4FRVT., 1973 4, io "(1) tiect;.  qT 'en) 	(ft; 	 ( 2) TTITTff 

(Exeteise. BOOk) rift   	4 zwei 	*TTr -  aril; Trt 	at.; e7tartr<*1 TT.±4 
19.atio.t 	 Ty arsnin3T sr+.r..,,a-  TT in  ;T: T.6iri 'TT, "Tfit  
ITI4TT4" Tfs-  fer 7fTqit 5:(q ria Ti 	111:i t 

( 2) TT 92ifkfTTIT T‘T am-  3-T 3;r-cf19-  se-t;t=  9-Nettrafl WI -41Tr 	lEFif 
.41t 	it 33•Crt fisifrff 	T (71 0 11'0-2- 662.4.TE1-1012-1972, 

-1-4-dtT 1.1-4.64ai 4,1  ; 1973.4', ‘4,101-',1".  Ta'r Tni 	ti<5.441 4W , TYR* 	Srlfbc.41 	zfiff TT 
fn•rifv4;11 	fq4.11 ‘.31 4.14i 	tiq 	.L401 Ma ii.i-sii. T7111., VOA': - - 

"4 	 5 5E11 	I d 

. 	( 3) "(TUT Sitgr ITT-147 tith1-19" .07 *9'1 et, 4..01) iffdl 	96,1976 9TTM 
*T171TSITZT ffTTT Tzurtencirff 771TITT ( 2) 419t.47 . .f-a7117r*  	frdirtct, 
vrtfr IT 97  ITT T1511.  a;i{ 	fwt ToTrzum-  rgrfin-rtr f** 	ffl- 

.2r 92.1t91  61'3 v t, feu*: 9277:2,TIK ikfcreqd: 	f9-oft-d-, ,too =a 
far 1717 1TIMT TniTT, TTaTT al CC Wei I ti 	Riff ,i,-14fr-ff • fait.fq- thft w1,4i7c 
TT 91r1 aft.1  IfTT TT 941 	tl11971, f9larTF, tti16:)n TIT qtAii f4dAr 11111.  an I 

17--1-4* r<4 Iowa 7T ifr   frupCE:4:1" 4ri v,thr *. UR' rn 
xrfertmi 	TR-P11 	f-*-zrr Trxr     za 4).  Tit .m-rit-  *rii- 	tit (fitf;i" 
;Et 	-f-lafru t 	 .7r agrsTfiL141 TrzT zraitialra• .TrT vfat-9-zni 
rig-a-74n .4 	 tr, 	tt 413( 141 	t fafagtif F;J'ifr, T9i.7( 
17177 1HU T WIW,Ct I 

No. 2309 (2) ,/XVII-V-I-82-76 

Dated•Luchnow, May 20, 1976 

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 34a,  of the .com."1:: 
stitution of India,. the Governor is. pleased to order the publication of the".  
following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh .  Bikri Kay (Sanshodhail 
Aur Vaidhikaran) Adhiniyam, 1976 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 23 cibl 
1976) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the-2 
Governor on May 19, 1976  

THE UTTAR PRADESH SALES TAX -(AMENDMENT AND 
VALIDATION) ACT, 1976 

[U. P. Act no. 25 of 1976] 
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature) 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the U. P. Sales Tax Act, 1948. 

IT IS Fantasy enacted in the Twenty-seventh Year of the RepubliC o 
as follows : 

bid 

This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Sales Tax (Amendment an 
Validation) Act, 1976. 

In section 3,-A of the U. P. Sales Tax Act, 1948 (hereinafter referred 1t..r;' 
as the principal Act) , for sub-section (1) 	the folldwingtsub-section shall be 
substituted, namely :-  

"(I) Except as otherwise provided in section 3-AA:  or section 3-0, di 
tax payable by a dealer under this Act shall be levied,- 

U. P. Act no. 
XV of 1948. 

Short title. 

Aemndment of 
section 3-A of 
U. P. Act 	no. 
XV of 1943. 

(a) on the turnover in respect of any fOod: or. drink served fn 
consumption in a hotel or restaurant or part thereof, with which. , 
cabaret or floor show is provided therein, at such rate, not exceeding 
forty per cent, as the State 	Government May, by notificatio 
declare ; and 



\TUT 	artMRYT 07F, 20 iff, 1976 	 9 

(b) on the turnover in respect of the goods specified in the second 
column of the First Schedule, at the point specified in the third 
column thereof, at such rate, not exceeding fifteen per cent, as the 
State Government may, by notification, declare, and different rates 
may be declared in respect of the different goods comprised in any 
entry in the said Schedule : 

Provided that the State Government may, by notification, omit the 
entry relating to any goods from the First Schedule, and may in the 
like manner restore any entry so omitted and upon the issue of 
any such notification omitting or restoring any entry, the said 
Schedule shall, subject to the provisions of sub-section (3), be 
deemed to be amended accordingly." 

In section 3-D of the principal Act, in sub-section '(1), the existing 
Explanation shall be re-numbered as Explanation I, and thereafter the follow-

jug Explanation II shall be inserted and be deemed always to have been inserted, 
namely :— 

"Explanation //—For the purposes of this sub-section, in relation to pur-
chases of foodgrains in pursuance of any order made under section 3 of 

o'of 	the Essential Commodities Act, 1955 or under rule 114 of the Defence 
and Internal Security of India Rules, 1971, including any purchase in 

'excess of the levy share, the purchase first made by a dealer from the State 
Government or its purchasing agent shall be the first purchase of such 
foodgrains and the tax shall accordingly be levied at that point on such 
dealer?' 	 . 	1 - 

For section 3-E of the principal Act, the following section shall be 
substituted, and be deemed always to have been substituted, namely :— 

"3-E. Every dealer, who on or after the twenty-first day of May, 1974, 
Levy of purchase purchases any goods subject to sales tax from a regis-

tax on certain tered dealer in circumstances in which no tax is payable 
transactions. 	by such registered dealer or from a person other than a 

sai 	registered dealer, shall be liable to pay tax on the purchase price of 
such goods at the same rate at which, but for the existence of the afore-
mentioned circumstances, the tax would have been leviable on the sale 
price of such goods: 

Provided that if the goods are liable to tax at only one point of sale 
and if such dealer proves to the satisfaction of the assessing authority 
that the goods purchased have already been subjected to tax or will be 
subjected to tax under any other provision of this Act, no tax under this 

{ section shall be payable : 
Provided further that where purchase of such goods was made before 

the twenty-sixth day of May, 1975, the preceding proviso shall be so 
construed •as if after the words "tax under any other provision of this 
Act," the words "or under the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 were 
inserted. 

Amendment of 
section 3-D. 

Amendment of 
section 3-E • 

Amendment of 
section 3-F. In section 3-F of the principal Act, for the words "Provided that", the 

following shall be substituted and be deemed with effect from the first day of 
April, 1975 to have been substituted, namely :— 

"Provided that in the case of foodgrains, the rate of additional tax pay-
able by any dealer, the aggregate of whose turnover or turnover of pur-
chases or both, as the case may be, liable to tax, exceeds rupees ten crores 
in an assessment year, shall be five per cent : 

Provided further that 

In section 3-G of the principal Act, in sub-section •(2) , at the end, the 
words "or if such department, company, corporation or undertaking has no 
office or establishment situated in Uttar Pradesh" shall be inserted. 

In section 4 of the principal Act, for clause (a) , the following clause 
shall be substituted and be deemed to have been substituted with effect from 
the second day of May, 1974, namely :— 

"(a) the sale or purchase of water, milk, salt, newspapers, motor 
spirit, diesel oil or alcohol as defined in the United Provinces Sales of 
Motor Spirit, Diesel Oil and Alcohol Taxation Act, 1939 or any other 
goods which the State Government may, by notification exempt ; or". 

Amendment of 
section 3-G. 

Amendment of 
section 4. 



I0 	
3NThIRUITfriC, 2o zit, 1976 

Amendment of 
section 4-B. 8. In section 4-B of the principal Act,— 

Amendment of 
section 8-A. 

in clause .(a) of sub-section (1), for the words and figures "where' 
any goods liable to tax under section 3-D are purchased by a dealer who 
is liable to tax on the turnover of his purchases or first purchases, as the . 
case may be, under that section", the words and figures "where any goods ' 
liable to tax under sub-section (I) of section 3-D are purchased by 
dealer who is liable to tax on the turnover of purchases or first pur-
chases, as the case may be, under that sub-section or where any goods are 
purchased by any dealer in circumstances in which such dealer is liable , 
to purchase tax in respect thereof under section 3-E" shall be substituted', 
and be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the twenty-first.' 
day of May, 1974; 

in clause (b) of sub-section (I), for the words "under any other 
section", the words "under any other provision of this Act" shall he 
substituted and be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 
twenty-first clay of May, 1974; and 

in sub-clause (c) of clause (i) of sub-section (4), for the words, 
brackets and figures "under sub-section (3)", the words, figure and 
letter "under section 8-C" shall be substituted and be deemed to have 
been substituted with effect from the first day of March, 1973. , 

9. In section 8-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (I-A), for clauses (c) 
and (d), the following clauses shall be substituted, and be deemed to have been 
substituted with effect from the first clay of April, 1976, namely :— 

"(c) In respect of every application for registration, a fee of rupees!, 
fifty shall be payable by the dealer. A fee of rupees twenty-five shall be 
payable for every assessment year or part thereof for which registration 
is sought to be renewed. 

(d) .  A person failing to apply within the period prescribed for regis-
tration or renewal, as the case may be, shall, without prejudice to the:: 
provisions of section 14 or section I5-A, pay, in addition to the requisite 
fee, a penalty of Rs.25 for every month or part thereof during which the:: 
default continues." 

Amendment 
section 8-B. 

Amendment of 
section 11. 

Amendment of 
section 32. 

of 	10. In section 8-B of the principal Act, for sub-section (2), the following-f 
sub-section shall be substituted and be deemed to have been substituted with 
effect from the first day of April, 1976, namely 

"(2) The application for provisional registration shall be verified in, 
the prescribed manner, and shall be accompanied by satisfactory proof T.: 
of the payment of a Fee of rupees fifty for the first assessment year or t 
part thereof, and rupees twenty-five for every subsequent assessment year 
or part thereof, for which it has been made." 

In section 11 of the principal Act, in sub-section (I), for the words 
"One hundred rupees", the words "two hundred rupees" shall be substituted. 

For section 32 of the principal Act, the following shall be substituted,.-. 
namely :— 

"32. (1) Subject to the provisions of sub-section (3), the fee pay' 
Fees in certain able on a memorandum of appeal under section 9 and 

cases. 	 other applications under this Act shall be as follows; 
(a) On a memorandum of 	 Two per cent of the amount of tax, 

appeal under section 9 	 fee or penalty in dispute, subject to 
a minimum of five rupees and a: 
maximum of olio hundred and fifty: 

On an application for 
revision under section 10, 
not being an application for 
stay of realisation of tax, fee 
or penalty 

On an application 
under section 35  

rupees. 

Seven and a half per cent of the 
amount of tax, fee or penalty in dis7. 
pute, subject to a minimum of fifteen 
rupees and a maximum of five hun-
dred rupees. 

Fifty Rupees. 



  Sfirr 8P,TTEITO:9" ;TWa., 20 	1 97 6 	 11 	221 
(d) On any other application :— 

(i) When addressed to 
the Commissioner of Sales 
Tax or the Revising Autho-
rity or any Additional 
Revising Authority 

(ii) When addressed to 
any other officer or autho-
rity 

Three Rupees. 

Two Rupees. 

(2) The fee referred to in this section and in any other provision of 
this Act or the Rules made thereunder shall be payable— 

by deposit into a treasury or sub-treasury or a branch of the 
State Bank of India in Uttar Pradesh, in which case a copy of the 
treasury chalan showing deposit of the requisite amount of fee shall 
be attached to the memorandum or application; or 

by cheque or bank draft, in which case it shall, along with 
treasury chalan in triplicate, be enclosed with the memorandum or 
application : 

Provided that where the amount of fee payable does not exceed 
ten rupees, the same may at the option of the dealer be paid by 
affixing court fee stamps on the memorandum or application, as the 
case may be. 

(3) No fee shall be payable in respect of— 
an application presented by the Commissioner of Sales Tax 

or any other officer or authority appointed under this Act or the 
Rules made thereunder ; and 

an application in which only information is sought and in 
which• no specific relief is prayed for." 

13. After section 34 of the principal Act, the following section shall be • Insertion 	ot 
inserted, namely :—  new section 35. 

35. 	(1) In any question arises, otherwise than in a proceeding 
Determination 	pending before a court or before an assessing authority 

of disputed ques- under section 7 or section 21, whether, for the purposes 
tions 	 of this Act,— 

any person or association of persons, society, club, firm, com-
pany, corporation, undertaking or Government Department is a 
dealer; or 

any particular thing done to any goods amounts to or results 
in the manufacture of goods within the meaning of that term ; or 

(e) any transaction is a sale or purchase and, if so, the sale or 
purchase price, as the case may be, therefor ; or 

any particular dealer is required to obtain, or to apply for 
the renewal of, registration ; or 

any tax is payable in respect of any particular sale or pur-
chase and, if so, the rate thereof, 

the person or the dealer concerned may, after depositing the fee speci-
fied in section 32, submit an application to the Commissioner of Sales 
Tax, alongwith such documents as may be prescribed. 

(2) The Commissioner of Sales Tax shall, after giving the applicant 
an opportunity of being heard, decide as he deems fit the question so 
arising : 

Provided that, before giving such decision, the Commissioner of Sales 
Tax may, in his discretion, ask an officer subordinate to him to make 
such inquiries as he considers necessary for the decision of the question. 

(3) No decision of the Commissionen of Sales Tax under this section 
shall affect the validity or operation of any order passed earlier by any 
assessing authority, appellate authority or revising authority. 

(4) No question which arises from an order already passed, in the 
case of the applicant, by any authority under this Act shall be enter-
tamed for determination under this section. 



12 7.C17. 9-,•M fl11TRT 71"qa; 20 Tr‘, 1976 

Amendment of 
the First Sche-
dule. 

A decision given by the Commissioner of Sales Tax under this: 
section shall, subject to an appeal to the High Court, be final. 

A copy of the decision given under this section shall be sent to 
the applicant and to the assessing authority concerned." 

14. In the First Schedule to the principal Act,— 

(1) for the entries against serial numbers 26, 32, 89, 62 and 112 he,: 
following shall be substituted, namely :— 

SI. no. 	 Description of goods 	 Point of tax 

III 

26 	All kinds of cosmetics and toilet preparations for beauti- M or I 
fication or care of the face, skin, hair, nails, eyes or 
brows, but not including soaps, safety razor blades, 
tooth pastes, tooth powders and other dentifrices, 
tooth brushes and ktunkunt. 

32 All electrical goods, instruments, apparatus, appliances M or I 
and all such articles the use of which cannot be had 
except with the application of electrical energy, in-
cluding fans, fluorescent tubes (including their starters, 
chokes, fixtures, fittings and accessories), electrical 
earthenware and porcelain and all other accessories 
and cpmponent parts, whether sold as a whole or in 
parts, but excluding electrical equipment, plants and 
their accessories required for generation, distribution 
and transmission of electrical energy, electric motors 
and parts thereof, torches, torch-cells, torch bulbs, 
dry cell batteries and filament lighting bulbs. 

39 All goods and wares made of glass, but not including 
plain glass-panes, optical lenses, hurricane lantern 
chimneys, bottles and phials glass-beads, clinical 
syringes, thermometers, and scientific apparatus and 
instruments made of glass. 

62 (a) Motor cars 

M or 1 

Sale to consut 
mer or Hire 
purchase comi 
pany financ74i 
ing the purl, 
chase by the7 
consumer. 

(0) Motor trucks and motor buses, including their cha-
ssis and motor bodies built thereon. 

(c) All other -rotor vehicles including their chassis and 
motor bodies of all shapes and designs (includ-
ing motor caravans and tankers), whether built 
on chassis or separately. 

Ditto. 

Ditto. 

112 (a) Electronic goods, equipment, appliances, and parts M or I 
and accessories thereof, but not including 
Television sets. 

(13) Television Sets 	 M or I. 

(2) for the entry in column II against serial number 89, the follot 
ing shall be substituted and be deemed to have been substituted lk'ik 

effect from the second day of May, 1974, namely :— 

"Spirits and spirituous liquors of all kinds, including methYtt. 
alcohol, but excluding country liquor and also excluding alcohol 
defined in the United Provinces Sales of Motor Spirit, Diesel 914 
and Alcohol Taxation Act, 1939." 



  

3fft sfkU sivrqr-car Trwa., 20 TTf, 1976 13 	,Z2; 

      

      

      

        

15. In the U. P. Sales Tax Rules, 1948 :— 

(I) in rule 12-A, for sub-rule (4), the following shall be substituted. namely 

"(4) No blank form shall be issued except on payment of fee by 
the dealer at the rate of Rs.3.75 per book of 25 forms or fifteen 
paise per form." 

(2) in rule 12-B, for sub-rule (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:— 
"(3) No blank form shall be issued except on payment of fee by 

the dealer at the rate of Rs.7.50 per book of 50 forms pr fifteen 
parse per form." 

(3) in clause (a) of rule 19, the words "in treasury along with 
chalans" shall be omitted; 

(4) in rule 20-B,— 
(a) in clause (a) , for the words "by a treasury chalan showing 

deposit", the words "by satisfactory proof of deposit" shall be 
substituted ; and 

(4 in clause (b), for the words "by a treasury chalan showing 
deposit", the words "by satisfactory proof of deposit" shall be 
substituted; 

(5) in rule 25-A,— 
for sub-rule (3), the following shall be substituted and be 

deemed to have been substituted with effect from the first day of 
April, 1976, namely:— 

"(3) A fee of Rs.50 shall be payable in respect of every appli-
cation for issue of recognition certificate under sub-rule (1), and 
a fee of Rs.25 shall be payable for every assessment year or part 
thereof for which recognition is sought to be renewed." 

(b) in sub-rule (5), for the full stop at the end, a comma shall 
be substituted and the following shall thereafter be inserted, namely :— 

"and shall be effective till the end of the assessment year in 
which it is issued. If the dealer wishes to get it renewed, 

he shall submit an application in accordance with sub-rule (I) 
before the date of its expiry, accompanied by satisfactory proof 
of deposit of the fee prescribed in sub-rule (3). If the Sales 
Tax Officer is satisfied that the application is in order and the 
fee has been deposited, he shall renew the certificate for such 
period, not exceeding three years at a time, as may be stated in 
the application for renewal." 

in sub-rule (11), for the word and figure "Rs.5", the word 
and figure "Rs.10" shall be substituted; 

(6) in rule 25-B, for sub-rule (2), the following shall be substituted, 
namely 

(2) A dealer holding a recognition certificate who wishes to 
avail of the concession referred to in clause (b) of sub-section (1) 
of section 4-B, shall apply to the Sales Tax Officer within whose 
jurisdiction his principal place of business is situate for the issue of 
blank Declaration Forms. No blank Declaration Forms shall be 
issued by the Sales Tax Officer except on payment of fee by the 
dealer at the rate of Rs.3.75 per book of 25 forms or 15 pause per 
form. The application shall be signed by one of the persons men-
tioned in sub-rule (1) of rule 25-A." 

(7) in rule 41, in sub-rule (1), the following second proviso shall be 
inserted, namely :— 

"Provided further that the dealer may, instead of submitting a 
return as aforesaid, estimate his turnover for the year on the basis 
of the turnover admitted by him in his return for the immediately 
preceding year, calculate the amount of tax payable thereon and 
deposit a sum equal to one-twelfth thereof during each of the first 
two months of every quarter, and deposit the balance of tax due on 
the turnover admitted by him in his return for the relevant quarter 
which shall be prepared and submitted in the manner laid down in 
this sub-rule." 

— 

Amendment of 
certain rules. 



4 	 39t sat afiffsirKrif Tf4E, 20 tit 1 97 6 

(8) in rule 46-A, for the words and figures "Rs.1 and 25 paise", the 
words "two rupees" shall be substituted; 

(9) in rule 46-B, for the word and figure "Re.1", the words "two 
rupees" shall be substituted; 

(10) in rule 54, for sub-rule (2), the following shall be substituted, . 
namely :— 

" (2) Each application shall be accompanied by satisfactory proof 
of deposit of fee and penalty specified in this Act, where payable" ; 

(11) in rule 58, in sub-rule (1) , for the words and figures "and a 
treasury chalan showing deposit of a fee of Rs.10 into the treasury", the 
words "and satisfactory proof of deposit of fee" shall be substituted; 

(12) in rule 61, for the words and figure "which shall be accompanied 
by a treasury chalan showing the deposit of a fee of Rs.2 in the treasury", 
the words and figure "which shall be accompanied by satisfactory proof 
of deposit of a fee of Rs.10"shall be substituted; 

(13) rule 63 shall be omitted; 
(14) in rule 70, in sub-rule (2), for the words and figures "Rs.1 and 

25 poise", the words "two rupees" shall be substituted; 
(15) in rule 77-C.— 

in sub-rule (1), for the words "twenty five poise", the words - 
"one rupee" shall be substituted; and 

in sub-rule (3), for the words "fifty poise", the words "one - 
rupee" shall be substituted; 

(16) for sub-rule (3) of rule 85, the following shall be substituted, 
namely :— 

"(3) No blank declaration forms shall be issued by the Sales Tax 
Officer except on payment of a fee of fif teen poise per form or 
Rs.7.50 per book of 50 forms. The application shall be signed by s;  
one of the persons mentioned in sub-rule (1) of rule 54 or a person.: 
duly authorised under rule 77-A." 

(17) for sub-rule (3) of rule 86, the following shall be substituted, 7: 
namely 

"(3) No certificate shall be issued except on payment of a fee of-
twenty paise per certificate." 

Amendment and, 	16. (1) In Government notification no. ST-II-6623/X-1012-1972, dated 
validation 	of December 1, 1973, issued by the State Government in exercise of its powers under' 
certain violin- section 4 of the principal Act, for the words "in respect of— (i) books andy catMns. 

magazines, and (ii) exercise books, if made from paper purchased withinL 
Uttar Pradesh, provided proof thereof is furnished by the dealer to the satisfac-
tion of the assessing authority", the words "in respect of books and magazines",, 
shall be substituted and be deemed always to have been substituted. 

In Government notification no. ST-I1-6624/X-1012-1972, dated Decem-
ber 1, 1973, issued by the State Government in exercise of its powers under 
section 3-A of the principal Act, for the entries against serial no. 4 of the Listy 
therein, the following shall be substituted, and be deemed always to have been 4 

substituted, namely :— 
"4. Exercise Books 	 5 per cent". 
Notwithstanding any judgment, decree or order of any Court or autho-.  

city, any tax imposed, assessed, levied or collected before the commencement of 
the Uttar Pradesh Sales Tax (Amendment and Validation) Act, 1976 undef, 
the notification referred to in sub-section (2) as amended by this section, shall 
be deemed to have been validly imposed, assessed, levied or collected in accord-, 
ance with law, as if the aforesaid notification, as amended by this section, hart': 
been in force at all material times when such tax was imposed, assessed, levied 
or collected. 

17. Notwithstanding any judgment, decree or order of any Court orl,. 
authority, anything done or any action taken (including any notification issued) 
before the commencement of this Act, not inconsistent with the provisions of the 
principal Act as amended by this Act, shall be deemed to be, and always tcr: 
have been, as valid and lawful as if the provisions of this Act had been in'— , 
(orce at all material times. 

9A-rwr 

comiqt 9vi 

Validation. 



397 11a157 anTRTitur ll‘rld, 20 lit:, 1076 	 15 

‘iP7h1q 

\d4L09. 	Tni 9719:,?jt 	2,3 OR: 4 *911,11Tr; 4{-9Tr 26,32,30, 62,89 a t 112 * T4-43-9-  Trafs-at T.-4H TT f9T9Iffiiici 	 grA-fra-Ert 	wwq").  :-- 

,2 '71:r tit tfT 

2 	 3 
	

4 

faavir Fziff 179.  cr( VT TT *1 
9it Tn.  

tr3r0 ft0-2-2 95 6/74---6 (i 7)-76 

20 4, 1976 

.371. Vk7111-W7T/T Tat VFETrfft4V, 1904 (uff-c Tkvr 	rfifT4 4,t§Tr 1, 1904) ,151' ETRI 21 iENT 9f6ff 7t-TT 1t1.  fF4-17-4: 	1948 t 0 ( 	 g "VT qTd- tIto1T 15,1948 1)) T.)* 1TRT 3-T er ativr-a (u) qt- q-1/')'1 q-PcT4TR 	Ttf1T q1-t* TT71111.19-  1k4i* 204 1976k 1TIT7-TTITT 	frtfira.  ,4-(mitr fTwfr-a- 	 at)" 	 012- 71, kt-cir 15 91PTT, 1971 11 *44 fifff ql)f en 

qq11.7, 	r, 	4.q Tr 	 TT kmn rmi 
SITI7 	ffl7q11;1-41i 7a: Tffru9- 71-11141, FTI1q" Tag urit tr.g-tlq"-c q,y,T2TaT.E, -.,,,ffErruTT1;fl-t12741t73, c1TVT Vrt N1:1-  
fimmitt 

4177. fra-191.  i WTITT9., 	uT,11Trarq 917' A-1M' qtri q17;11 
TT 	t 	 rerfqa-  ejfr 9{1' .11:1"Tffl.  fr?. 1Att riff i'1:1;d1Tff 
8.WP-7-  714 (ft17*7,-F-d-T4 	 qTtl, TZE*61 	t, 

fIhre..7 	 fT .*-crcfaTT111-q Trbz T141- 

	

ffi5T4 HI4 V-17 471-1Trnr mrr t, 	ar Vff: rfr 
i*Tiral., ITT-1 w:Fra'f-av: W9T, ficwir 9A-17 

CIT€Crgr 	 IT-qt 	4-4wr, 4-4N Tr'r-c :59* 11-1.4 	
11111T.91, Tc1f47;41.1tR7 ert•117i MTh Er4, FT4 	Z-14 
yr-i-49'4t 	rii;z9-rvfa-Tr 	tifrifra" 91T (t. I 

	

39fid 

 Wirq g7T 1TM-6- ET111T9' 	TrT7, Fri;   ITIF,T 	IT)971, 
9Wr 	giti, 711i-7 7711.7 T9' F-T1T4t, 4144 TrIT tuft, TT9' 
	 (trs ) , 	fi-14,1141k7, 	4P; *fa m-t 	1T- 

fltb tiq3itr: 31.T7.-.11- 11raTir75 	t I 

7) T1177 TT?: 

	

Ogr)Zrit"-< cfr: 	q11. 	w7,-Fia.  73-9* 4R,Fr 417 u9- 
;TirPta:7 T7117 t 

	

wft TIT?? ziTfart f 	 4f;?r4 	1:141 
VT7 TT. 1117177317:79" *-1 Tfte:t qrri•IT 	T.T.=4;t4 	Trr.qt 
3;r17. 55:1,7 -4ft 	vr?, 4144 ERTT44c1t4 

26 

32 

fkowjirwo 12 rf T 

f9.01Xgq7 iTT 
	

12 qraiTU 

f-,401qq'T 1:IT0 
	

z Treira 

uTiftqa-r *7;j4 
	

qrffTra.  
fT*r TrTar .atr- 
IT'H7r q-r-cr 	* 
fFe fdff aTqE1T1 
Tt4 qi4-1 W11 
fT*T t441- 

TrsT VTA I 

aiq 	9 Artgrff 

12 Sirci6cT 



16 	 \to t Srktj TADOTTur TrAZ, 20 Trf , 1976 

1 	 2 	 3 	4 
11 

	

89 	 ftcfo4q 	<14, fT7fiiTAT‘TT 3AT1Vip-  Einif9-9.  fro 3:reTAI TITO 12 Aft7O- 
t, fq,(1 .ivrt wcrqufiTrfff9- 9- 1 ql-tfg44 	atzt 4it-c 
Rsie, t79' 9Zrzi9" TeTT 32.4tgW 	VfaintrIT, 1939 ___ *4-11-4-1149- 	t 

	

112 	(T) 9iT<T1-9% TT AMA g I i‘dLi f,u1 5;117 3 	iif 	ft0 1ATTT TIO • 12 Aft1116.  '• 
1311119.  fobro,.‘741.19-q-9- 4z.111Th1f9.9. 9t t I 

(u) 	ftfr4E 	 19-  o 9TAV TT 0 	7 Aid.  PTA 

4:EottqTro a - 0 2-.2967174-6( 17)-76 

citq 	, 20 Al, 1976 
.-1 71 sTkITT AT9T11714.‘32TErrigH, 1904 (397 AkUT ilifflArT W571 1, 1904) TnT UHT 21 %11114'1 

4166' rift AkUT104t-TT AUT, 1948 t 0 (A.AT Tfk/T 	9157 15, 1948 0) it ',111:T 3-F -TT 	TRV 
(2-T) % gf-9-47-a iciit 143 % 9TETPti Triphi 	t TT 71:1)11T.T% TT1TTOTW, ft9tx 2 0 111, 1973 4, 4.97-44 q-  TtT 

znp.otNilfau 	 fq-jfca.  titg4 	7,To eta-2-4949197-10 (2)-74, 1001T 30 111, 19/5A ftuir9t15::: 
WINIA TTR t 

#tritm 

4-09' WM:1%T TIT.111,A1 if, WIT 111T-0TT 30% AVAT7 f64#.7figra. 	TI:CM" WiT 4)* TTAif, TIAft,-17 

TIT 0t0 	mici TT ftT11111 R-17 T-74 TT TT 
WiTAT 

1 
	

2 	 3 

31 	09u7, 	T:131 fta (ATi ) , 31T-1, ( uTTT 4T1T (-4t-c,13FE 01401 ), ftGRA- 01 32TO 	3 Tif9715.  
Va).. 9tti gPTw7T4 ,01;idni frfST914.3tR 	 

trfaT uhr (4TF9T9. 11 ,1 	) 941T 41-4.-fi 	4 srq-ilr 
qTR 419ti 	trui t PT;  I 

(ft111-7A0it02-2958frE---9 ( 1 ) - 7 6 

9179\31, 2-0 lit, 1976 

T STiV1 11TTETTTA 47, Trfuf9-ar4, 1904 (37T SR T VIITNAUT 11041 1, 1904) it 9TTi 21.T; 
ATufTi661 397 0i1 UT ft%).--TT TE,11948 t7--, 0 ( 397 01W FtfT FtWIT 15, 1948t 0 ) 	tfTTT 4-Ef 
TrEtet9" WriTTTT.1 TT Aint WT% 6.1111 Ault -111117 crc TAT-APIttiTa ITTTITT ftecff W0AT TY,T Oa 0-2-4938r 
q211- 10 ( 2) -74, fg91-T 30 111, 1975 TT Wt-671TuT TT% TT1749T91  z17 TriT 	t-T VET 

ITWF ATTNW 	ft-91-T 4-, efT 3Tff ETTTT 4-€11 	faf9ftcz 	MTV fT4119-WT 	Tfitffc;1  
Te - 

( 1 ) 11F41 9 	V-KT cifti4TEZ Tr 3199'19'9' 979'i fqiurqu  19i1:19.  017 TT ifT1121:1.,  
TRATIT T fffit 9it"rfua-,fTEnr`Troi-  4T9' 'fa:ET 4 tTttit trfrt Ert,47thErth', 7.7% giTT fT• ii 

Tti.  (TT, arft9ttm-rt crf-evrca 2 	f- ftgru f79:i 5Fzuftra.  wei-  717 U.1111-T 1;177TIT WT4 
A TN' Ai TT TWFiT NA, 9117 Aft qq.  TT07 1t1TA 179f 	irfit XTA art. qi ft917 

rafat f9-q, Tit TT kat 911 

5rfa-wa Er fT7R119.511TuT TT€ TT f79.17 19t, 1979% AT-7. 7 .6111 (1.1 
( 2) fTift TTt gm AftftTET 3 4 ez,fffigfff ITTA ft1Ttur W1TATUTUNT-111.11TW itATT0;.,1 

WT0111%me 52"AftTU fTit “Tti 1:179."  i 44-9-  4 	TT it Trt fa-771-  trr, AgrWa., 
fTi 	70.  TT Tit TT 	Wtt UM; 

(a) 11197:Tff €1:7; ( 1) WAT ( 2) 4.3t-tTlftfa* ;Wit 4517 fTTIT W.T11 WWW ft7g 
TF-01161  WITTIAit 	ZIATTITt TAT TTAT, TctAT, ftAT0 	<I I ftaT9-9Tt it UT9ti fent.  ic 
f1/44103-911 thig'AT ffAT ftufT1T9Tt UFT7 (AA tkikT ) q.91Th- 	Ait .WT7711 911:  a,17131% ggil4 



Fic.I'c ;14qt ,4711C41.,,I `1,1C, sunRi 	•-• 	 l• 

fir4171T8-11117T1707 ;mar 	f9-1TTa.  41.9-  41-i1i4 4 utrsitir fffir 'aim., *7; 	 
*1 4 Ter fq't zit 77iff917,7TT kITT fT1-1t  •7E? 4797 TT 9..17.  Et-TIfT1TT78-1kT EFT, VYFff  
1 9 4 	 3-9.*;rrit7izr9A-f7f749.T77)-1kft Ti&erifil-nrfTTI Tinzn 
7747T:-- 

(T) Tag f977 TT 7171-977, 1956 (71.111977 81M 74, 1956) 
Tct TiTT 14 if 97T-OT91179' FT.97.7 	 2 ,5117/17 

(8r) 8RO 	 3 srf 	RE 

'(ii) fT T'TT1' 	 4 71.717T7 

gi.k.kr111.9.t fT 	T.T11". rTT f4r978iTrfT 1 9 4 0 T74-cf ipg 7x4t4 ftth:41 T47, q7. 
3/4.41.tra:t w Flo 	1,1 	TrEit9.' ot:1 ft,iiqi 141+1,1 9-  i.14 11-  I 

CitalTrTr:--'( 1 ) r t•  8wr{' T ffRqi fTkft 4,4 *TTqi4 w4vriwr 4 t f44Y 	141 .1, 37 

710i zn EfEMT-Sql 	s(zrilr@ur er ET\TT "TAVI-4 f47.1 	TiT7414 rfr cuc1I4' 74 4 	slat if' 
FrzT TR( g.1,simq( 9.78* wingit'd 3;rra- fwiTrit N7  1:1* mmiff 91.  Fro' fritrr cpt.1 arq-  f 
+IR /It 	tmik-  7T10140ci I 	-i c ttWIVIT9T 71 rill 	AT 1W4i =14+11 "I t%01 ZIT .11.0t0ci 

*i wet-4*r zrr srffr<Rftrifwa. 	 t 

( 2) tNicLI Iqr140,,+-4 .1) 	 wrdiri4 73-Er f(ilts 	t 	farrfcra• zi-FT 	fffTrinT if 

	

4t,171errfTrzrritir Ti? 	fOrfaff 	inrirtmi srp-"Isfczr rwra 7PT I 

qtrfITCZ 1 

• 

	

( ) 	Katz fanftre 	*I tit 

1 MAW f.-79' 41tTr 1:ITZT7 7R711147. 

2 9197 1-ETT 

3 	079' 31114-1T-17 f7914.EJT 

4 fTliqz.K1 

  5 rertzr 

6 ki-7211 

7 7-19.1717 

8 ETV-479' ifE 

8 	ffafirirt ( fix ffrt ) 

to ETTrfT 9 9-4 7fgq.  

TPTUTT 9.411-T 9T7-11TITT8, 41411.7t4, t 7ir f-F,k 

12 	4.1749T, ifww; 71'77 9•7T WITIT 197491' 71- 7trafTi 

13 	zT77 79T Zak' 

14 	7. 5 fT 0470 Titz7 4 Via* * 19799.  T-TZT 

15 

	

	Tff179 	9;r;646 Mu-114w fa98-tv8, Tifcw rr,f8t, 78.:(Trf7,T 8:f1T8•,1Frors 

EffIlazt Trzz7 lft ej 

16 	ires(71 (11744,7T-T ) 

17 artit fffc11-  qatg 

18 	t-771t 7717 Trt 43t 

19 fErwrf Tre(8- 

20 T,tfirETTItT 

21 	10 4041- 0x o 4 oft o 4.* *TIT T 717.1 94 

22 4'q018'w 

23 • terf 97T Tz;?EiT 

24 7T7a7 7za 	wfa4 qsrffr 	(fEuirfEw 17E-C7FE,T) 

25 	.64TENW t 71 	TT77-,17;7fZT kr79 TIT 1-71-ZIT 

,? 2 



Mqt w1laut91 	 zu +1s,, le in 

26 	*I' 7firg, fTa-trfkw qfirru ffq'T q'Tzlt9"16 7f9t 
27 	T'Itirlf aff 3. tr.P" (Tin TnT51Th2Tcli) 	raf9.9"1191:111 WI q1117 9"1"%T 
28 	;7.;.  (9- A--Nrz) 9.  T (tW 
29 	T'c,E't 

Is  

1 32T,M)I1 

2 q171,11Tid 

3 

4 4f9717 

5 ktqr 

6 4nTO- 

7 Wfth 
8 4-q1-4 

9 iirart. 

10 WItiti 

11 katkill 

12 .g 

	

13 	El-q'T 

14 tgq1-41 

15 Ti€11-4Tq 

16 

17 iT4W19' 

18 ITRAt 

19 iti31 

	

20 	1:11-7,14T 

	

21 	Tq-l't 

22 •WT-A19* 

trikture 2 

Th1Ti it Rgt 
23 1119T 

24 Ti 

25 91-1MgT 

26 	If qcit 

27 9-KT 

28 TITTkTkrq 

29 tri#11,11W 

30 tIRTITT;Ff 

31 SiffitrIg 

32 izrikt 
33 TiliciT 

34 viRWV 
35 flingT 

36 VaTTIT 

37 %0-9q1q' 

38 riNiq 

39 Uff7tIctri 

ttfkftm 3 

4? ( 2) 4 fdifE famtqa ITER 	ra 
1 	wriediff, i 	fwf, thi 94n, teR 39* tiqrzIT'14.  ffeTT ITN I 
2 	TN' 9251( Wi'dT1 1:1171T9', fxFir mt").  WITITr 91Tri WT tw 41.  ilfriffwa• t 
3 	fi911:17._f9T,F1177 NW( ETFkE g19.0719. 	 f9T17T Trzrt c I 

41TT11.  51-T7 V ififf WIT19; 	4-1 Fent RIT Wre.-TC IT) tin-nrwa•  t 
5 	747 9tR TT< * 37114 I 

6 4174:

•  
	I 

7 k , gre97, q91119., ftT97 Tit< kTr44 frail 9IT Titriq   14Erzw 
fc'tqff (414r4) 	TI:fq-3ttrI7 I 

9 	17177 IFK OK 39* 911Ta  I 

10 	147 t4 TT TfTif17 fm4 Waliff d'Tq 	9:OR t44nrn ffqTfrg.ijflijq9 utr4-ur net:, 
irfv-4f7a.  t 

11 	4.41zr fa-44 WK 9;1511974T, 1956 (9;rfith=r4 iarr74,1ss6)ft til7T 14# Ina 

rafreTT ftm w'ru aii WO' I 



. \Id 5ft‘49-3X4T9Tru. T 17T, 20 11{, 1976 	 19 

' 	n71-7404'0- 2-300 5/14--1035( 20)-74 

9'99$, 20 7rt, 1976 

iivr 	rarcur fl 111Tf971:1, 1904 
tr1(121 T R14 9fdffZWL5Itur IT-4t-TT ql?, 1948 
VTT 4 T REI17 9;rfETTI TTAT(111 WTT., TP7979" UT f 

fa-gfca-  Otri.  qfr oit 0- 2- 6623R'29"--1012-
ffffl2r .  #iftuff,TU' t:-- 

ktTitqff 

urrtwa* faff fca-41: 	( ) Vpz ( 2)T ,179 4T fff;ff fff 13 a' T9fqq-r 71.4z1T, 	 efT 
4 	a cit." 

qt7T-70tC0-2-3006ka.--1035( 2 0)-74 

9'9-97, 20 zit 1976 

. 	• 	Td-T 	4111171IF 917,T Trfirf9-4TT -1904 (TifT. tik.51-3:11419-1-11" ti,'914i 1, 1904) Tt URI" 21i tiefq 
sfratecit sr:2.• T.Tfcir4-TRiictd, 194 s to (kgr 15, 1948k0) 	UTTT 3-T T5' Tt-ci 	ti 
(2-T) T AfTA;;STITTIT 91M T Weft9-  Trfirrif srtir 	 . 

. 	fT, 	Tr -T SITIftiff tr* ft4i-T t, FITT* 	Tfrawr-TTFro 	o - 2- 6624Iq4- 
1012-1972,1.1 	it 1 fea'r47, 1.973 T-r 7rd 	Thfriff eTrrfr 1. ; 3417 

9.-9;fTkir tfT, Werfff ftlich frg9-ifwT rit TT;IT- 2 4 3feWriTif 41.7 T 4r47-ar 
ITTP" UffTT, ii 	ThqjwiiVitriffTe rTi fkt F49-  TT, ‘'q-a" fltF.a74-3 w..4% 
%. .4441:4 	EffrE; 	TT TT 17 e+Tr 

7RT-ftizrr 
	

la-aTur 

1 
	

2 	 3 

LiTriff thrrA7 
	

2  Afff9Ta" 

2-jan 	 5 51. "919' 

3-TTRMT (Exercise Books) 
	

5 grffiTM" 

?:1 ,s41.-11:40 ft0-2-30071q-4--1035(.2 0)-74 

7.919-9-T, 2d, 1976 

,37ffr.71/4DT f-4*-TTTS7_, 1948 t (:797.51.k7k4 4Tiqr 15, 19481t 0) Tt aFT. 4-9 T Vthi 
..3xfurei r qtr)-4r ;titti; Tiv<TTRT M.41 	tfi, 	f-aft5 ITFT ii. srFTRTI erk 	fk9fl92-IT 73- 7:47 
WTI 	fifrirqtd 	iiTrix ftN- Eft9.  Rze 37, rwerft,431179749' gi 	 f7Fi' qiif9q-9T ¶1514TaT  
knitcri-  W91* 4 qi 79* TM' q",1 ITT wrI441 	ifsr4tir %197,n 	1" 171 g2:t r9"9" T••• 419' 

#frn 4r, vnfeTra-, '4" TT 	kTrff ell' I 

4,141 IT,402'10-2-9251h.ff--5( 1)-73 

	

g 	 20 lit 1976 

797 9:17 	i:Fe, 1948 t,0 (dr' 	WkDT ff?.: #7,6.11 15, •1948 #.0) Tmnrgr4 	q'titi 	Tr, 

	

TT TM-.  +x% i.1,7).44 1f1¶rt 	T73- 	TrAzsrrftra.  pi)4 * fT9-t% fra-nr 7, 1-T-Rct Trp-- 

( ) Trri 	• 
(2). fp. 	 T6T9' 9.3.7 trr q-,,gm T.17 4'5:WI:* iTth CT,Err, itT 

(3WTyr 	IST1`974 trt€71' 1,1904) TY 
t,0 e3tTT fT?qT 15, 1948 0) Ti" 

d•W tiff T ;TWa. 	qw11417 eiq 	fq91T.  4 
1972, ft9i"T' 1 fkffT4T, 1973 k 17r4- 



20 	 WT aka ARTUTTAT 	, 20111, 1976 

( 3) aw4tzr 	wiaairr 	(g 	< 	?fkzr ?Fr), via ar gr7a 3rOTT, ¶V9 1T 

( 4) A,ZTA 14irctli 51fafffai 111+0.7E1.T em (41*("TIT

• 	

A Alifilv.17q), 

(5) IT,a-TA fafft Earcrver 	.9.1-1A 	BARA 	. • 
vTa 4 ‘ific; .14 g'ig al., 	faqr *NTT faanr 1Tra Trt fat TT 81-0 qTE* 9ZEfri g-4 Trr* AT'eft TT 
krf 91):  ...)01 IT Mlle a'rq-  :ufgaf 	rfyu Ai-tilt, WI 	afra. a'r-t r.g, e• ay M41Il1I1 
7;,11 ATAPT TT 11+016.-4A TT filth-T.  ANTI-ft T'T 	Tk FT m 	rcl VTA k7).  fiTtA t 	4, ;1 qtr. We TT 3114)-7 

fel 	al-c 	vra Trzar tia 4 a 	!ell 4 crisa Trqr .:-- 

( ) ac,tra <rbr-c, 	4 ;lea via aiivr ar 	KTA 41-Tarc *lath.' 	keg m'r T'r 
tfrtfrff, a-r9 	ttt1-T frfft1110,:tA, Titi 9TT,Era 	<ggr aftrarer a 4. 

AT fabw, tiqzr gartrr-c farm, Ac,ZTA,zrriTy' TISITITAT, 910171AT 1.6111,6 tIcrm Iti

FTTIT AT fu Trat, acra 11-T6AT UTT; 

( 2) dtti 	5FTR%Zwftftitft Fdt Th"f •ft %red' 	4,,tar 714zra-r, vaa \Pito Mr 
azriaa 	fg;icr arc Frtr-frirgr.e. fath.  wzr a-R.17ra' wrcr ; 

(a) v1Ttcn0.1:1FA 31-fiRTA A9-  *ter Tuft Pg-t fegth-4,*41r;rd., gr&o Troth° 
*4 	'co tto zrr 44* TM g 	41.aa fa7 fat 11.  a r4-fargIsg: fat war TrFaart.  
g 	; ith 

( 4) ftTRT.1 	etc 	* 	ra fau 41nr, %IVA tt it AT qTXi9 	rfft 11...ZT4 

<eerc, r 	ñFi i i4„tra 4Ral 	fkfi ru ara-1rr1g7: uerit arAiart * f** 
etTTTt nT 

-••••• 

#1F17-711" 0 2'1' —2-870frc---11 (11)-75 

. 	cvo .4,20 'It, 1976 

71-WC Ak7 fit-TT 	1948 0 (87T 51.0T .TE'11'WT 15,1948 t 0) 4‘1"un7 4 Arra; (111) 
Igt:N firtit TT A:1111T7i th/091.9.  AltA 'tat ft.  fq-i-it-f 1'1S19, 19701, fagaua fritRi4r{Tr 

wit fFeer Trra aThr 	wc, ar-c TI1 781-A T NV, 360' '<rqT, VAN-  Ti& TT -kg g 	 Orr 

.4137T—T30 Z".0-2-2959/7A--11( 33)-73 

9111-9, 20 At., 1916 

.1zn ft- 	Z, /948 f-,0 (8.W.T 7.kA 	110TT 15, 1948 -{0 ) TIT1T1U 4 Un (A) 
7111A afaret TT Tarr t 	tti; 7,117-71TM AT4 	41 kat fw, fiat*.  119, 1976W, fao'r 4,4 gal-41 OTT ACW-61.  

(efw 	AITT 	fiT7-1TA 	iftT TffrrtT<Tfl5 	9;111..1,1 Tt-Tifif 

qiffsfa.  AT9' TT tio0ciCt". 	fp-d; 324413.54.  TRAIT. 	/Zit* tc-14.89T TT.481nT AM* 

i-991 t I 

Th3AT-0.50 era - 2— 2 960/-RJC--900 ( 30)-70 

MAT3.4, 20 Tit 1976 

‘7177 	Fa0-T-C T.1,V2 1948 to (3W?".. 37k7I" 6.":ift. 4,57T 15,1948) T-t am 4 Tv! (q) 

5TRTTit wtrir ch-7:<1, TraTt 717 	327k'W -in FT..FP751T 17,7, 1976 9. "( 	1.1TfT 

tiir 	3,1"-4141 	It gm ' arz-K ar* *ma" fg 97 \lqt-1 1.-1Te.  ToriT Th-)e. T7.-. kg.  at @fa I 



   

TriT qffrtirr,or TrAZ., 20 iTe,, 1 975 21 

        

No. ST-II-2956/X-6 (17)-76 

Dated Lucknow, May 20, 1976 

,
lx exercise of the powers under clause (b) of sub-section .(1) of section 

.5-A of the U. P. Sales Tax Act, 1948 (U. P. Act no. XV of 1948), read with 
tiction 21 of the U. P. General Clauses Act, 1904 (U. P. Act no. I of 1904) , 
0:141' e  Governor is pleased to make, with effect from May, 20, 1976, the following 
inendment in Government notification no. ST-II-332/X-1012-1971, dated 

'November 15, 1971 as amended from time to time : 

Amendment 

. IN the Schedule to the aforesaid notification, for the existing entries under 
eolumns II, III and IV against items 26, 32, 39, 62, 89 and 112, the follow- 
iñg 	shall be substituted : 

Ii 

26. All kinds of cosmetics and toilet 
preparations for beautification or 
care of the face, skin, hair, nails, 
eyes or brows but not including 
soaps, safety razor - blades, tooth 
pastes, tooth powders and other 
dentifrices, tooth brushes and Kum-
Kum. 

M or 1 	12 per cent 

	

3.2. All electrical goods. instruments,. 	 M or I 	12 per cent 
apparatus, appliances and all such 
articles the use of which cannot be 
had except with the application of 
electrical energy, including fans, 
fluorescent tubes (including their 
starters, chokes, fixtures, fittings and 
accessories), electrical earthenware 
and porcelain and all other acces-
sories and componem parts, whether 
sold as a whole or in parts. hut ex-
cluding electrical equipment, plant 
and their accessories required for 
generation, distribution and trans-
mission of electrical energy, electric 
motors and parts thereof, torches. 
torch-cells, torch bulbs, dry cell 
batteries and filament lighting bulbs. 

	

39 All goods and wares made of glass, 	 M or I 	12 per cent 
but not including plain glass-panes. 
optical lenses, hurricane lantern 
chimneys, bottles and phials, glass- 
beads, clinical syringes, 	thermo- 
meters, and scientific apparatus 
and instruments made of glass. 

Motor Car 	 Sale to consumer 	7 per cent 
Motor trucks and motor buses, 	or Hire purchase 	9 per cent 

	

including their chassis and 	company finandng 
motor bodies built thereon. 	the' purchase by the 

consumer 

All other motor vehicles in- Ditto 	12 per cent 
cluding their chassis and motor 
bodies of all shapes and designs 

 

(including motor caravans and 
tankers) , whether built on 
chasis or separately. 



22 	
3979-k5T 9;171111-7qT ;77T., 20 Tit 1 9 7 6 

89. Spirits and spirituous liquors of 
all kinds, including methyl alcohol, 

.: but excluding-  country liquor and 
also excluding alcohol as defined in 
the United Provinces Sales of Motor . 
Spirit, Diesel Oil and Alcohol Tax- • 
ation Act, 1939. 

112. (a) Electronic goods, equipraents, 
appliances, and parts and 
accessories 	thereof, but not 

.including Television sets. 
(b) Television sets. 

_ 

HI IV 

M or I 12 per cent  

M or I 	12 per cell 

M or I 
	

7 per ctirl 

No. ST-II-2957/X-6 (17) -76 

Dated Litchnow, May 20, 1976 

Ix exercise of the powers .under the proviso to sub-section (2-A) of se•cfs:; 
lion 3-A of the U. P. Sales Tax Act. 1948 (U. P. Act no. XV of 1948), reacr(!: 
with section 21 of the U. P. General Clauses Act, 1904 (U. P. Act no. I 0P,4 
1904) . die Governor is pleased to make, with effect from May 20, 1976, tli& 51 
following amendment in Government notification no. ST-II-4949/X-10 (2)-74,7 
dated May 30, 1975. as amended front time ,to time : • 

Anl endment 
• 

IN the Schedule to the aforesaid notification, after serial no. -30, thi,4 following serial shall be inseried, namely : 

Serial no. 	Description of goods 	 point at which . 	Rate 
tax shall be 	of.  fait.> 

levied 

II III 	IV 

  

31. Maps, educational Charts, instru-
ment boxes, educational globes and 
instruments. such as • instrumentS 
used in mechanical drawing and 
biology, used by students. 

No. ST-11-2958/X-9 (1)-76 

on 	3 per cent 

    

Dated Luchnow„ May 20, 1976 

IN exercise of the powers under section 4-B of the U. P. Sales Tax Act, 
1948 - (U. P. Act no. XV of 1948), read with section 21 of the U. P. Generalit 
Clauses Act, 1904 (V. P. Act no. 1 of 1904), and in supersession of Government 
notification no. ST-n-4938/X-10 (2)-74, dated May 30, 1975, as amended fronill  
time to time, the Governor is pleased to order that, with effect from the date eIj! 
publication of this notification in the Gazatt, and subject to the conditioilgli:' 
and restrictions specified in i lit-said section 4-B,— 

(1) 	no tax shall he payable on the sale 10 or, as the case may be 
. purchase by a 'new' unit .  in respect of raw materials, required by it 4) 

use in tile manufacture of the goods mentioned in Annexure I or 
the packing of the .  Said goods manufactured by it, for a period of fiiie) 
years from the date of starting production, if the new unit is establisheill:,; 
in the districts mentioned in Annexure II and for a period of three: 
years from such date if n is established in the remaining districts 
the State: 

Provided that the date of starting.  production does not fall later tha# 
the first day of January, 1971 ; 

. „ 
(2) no tax shall be payable on the sale to or, as thecase may be4 

purchase by any unit in respect of 'raw materials' required by it 
. 	. 

use in the manufacture of the goods mentioned in Annexure 
or for the packing of the said goods manufactured by it ; 



2 3  
alT1 7 ?-24 I ui 77a', 2o III, 976 p.-7- • 

' 	• 

(3)- in the case of any unit other than those referred to in clauses 
(1) and (2) above, but not including Distilleries and Breweries and 
units engaged in the manufacture of paper, catechu (Kattha), Matches, 
empty match-boxes, match-splints and match-veneers, tax shall be 
leviable on the sale to or, as the case may be, purchase by the said 
units of "raw materials" acquired by it for the manufacture or packing 
of goods manufactured by it at die concessional rates, inclusive of ad- 
ditional tax, if any, payable Under Section 31; of the said Act of 1948, 
indicated below :— 

(a) Oilseeds as defined in section 14 of the 
Central Sales tax Act, 1956 (Act 74 of 
1956) 	• 2 per cent 

(b) Oil Cake 
3 per cent 

(c) Any other 'raw material' 	 4 per cent 
• 

Provided that no concession under this notification . shall be admissible 
if the goods manufactured by the unit are not liable to tax at any stage under 
die said Act of 1948. 	 • 

Explanations— (1) 'New unit', means a factory or workshop using machinery 
_or accessories or components thereof, not already used or acquired for . 	• 
,•,use in any other factory • or workshop in Uttar Pradesh but does not in-
dude any factory or workshop established on the site of an existing factory 

:.';•or workshop manufacturing the same goods or any addition.  to or extension :of an existing factory or workshop. 

(2) 'Date of starting production' means the date on 'which any raw 
inaterial required for use in the Manufacture or packing of the.  notified goods \is purchased for the first • time. 

1 

ANNEXURE 1 

List of Notified gooth referred to in clause' (1) 

Oil Engines and Oil Expellers 
Power tillers 

Polly Propylene filaments 
Reractories 

Storage Batteries 
Radios 

Phonograms 

,8. Television Sets 

Switch-gears (Electric) 

Plastic Products 

Hospital Equipment 
syringes. , 

Scientific, professional, measuring and process control 
Tyres and Tubes 

Electric motors of more than 7.5 kw rating 

Chemicals, including industrial explosives, nitric 
acid, stable bleaching powder. 
Perfumery 

China Potteries 

Sewing machine needles 
Sewing machines 

Transformers 

Heavy pumps of sizes above 10 cm.x10 an. 
Electric Equipment 

Pumps and Compressers 
24. Soap and other synthetic detergents 

and Surgical instruments, needles, and 

nstruments 

acid, sulphuric 



2 4 \d-fcr 5rkur 32-9- rain Tri'7.", 2 0 Wt., 1976 

Boiled and stand oils, synthetic resins and printing inks 
Fatty acids, stearic acid and oleic add 
Drying oil Products, viz, linoleum and oil-cloth 
Lubricants and greases 

- Scooters. 

ANNEXURE II 

List of districts 

Almora 	 21. Hardoi 
Azanagath 	 22. falaun 
Bahraich 	 23. faunpur 
Ballia 	 24. f hansi 
Banda 	 25. Lalitptir 
Bara Banki 	 26. Mainputi 
Basti 	 27. Mathura 

S. Badaun 	 28. Moraciabad 
Bulandshahr 	 29. Pilibhit 
Chamoli 	 30. Pithoragarh 
Deoria 	 31. Pratapgarh 
Etah 	 32. Rae Barth 
Etawah 	 33. Rarnpur 
Faizabad 	 34. Shahjahanpur 
Farrukhabad 	 35. Sitapur 
Fatehpur 	 30. Sultanpur 
Garhwal 	 37. Tehri Garhwal 
Ghazipur 	 38. Unnao 
Gonda 	 39. Uttarkashi. 
Hamirpur 

ANNEXURE ILI 

List of Notified goods referred to in clause (M 

Bicycles, tricycles, perambulators and accessories and parts thereof2 
Glass and glass-ware including optical glass in all forms. 
Oils extracted by solvent extraction process. 
All kinds of packing materials including cases and containers 

-5. Rubber and rubber products 
6. Pencils 
7. Paints varnishes, enamels, thinners and allied surface coating pto-a!, 

3 ducts and constituents thereof. 
Vitreous enamelled products 
Pressure Cookers and parts thereof 
Sports goods including sports shoes and playfield and gytnnasiute 
equipment. 
Iron and Steel :IS defined in section 14 of the Central Sales Tax Act,  
1966. 

No. ST-2-3005/X-1035 (20) /74 

Dated Lucknow, May 20, 1976 

IN exercise of the powers under section 4 of the U. P. Sales Tax Acel 
1948 (U. P. Act no. XV of 1948), read with section 21 of the U. P. Gener4,-,, 
Clauses Act, 1904 (U. P. Act no. 1 of 1904), the Governor is pleased to mak ._e k; 

with effect from the date of publication of this notification in the Gazette; 
following amendment in Government notification no. ST-2-6623/X-1012-7  
dated December 1, 1973 :- 

Amendment 

In the aforesaid notification, for items (i) and (ii), the following .sha 
be substituted namely :-"Books and Magazines." 



stkvr vEtrarCur 1177., 2 0 Drf, 1976 

No. ST-2-8006/X-1035 (20)-74 

Dated Lucknow, May 20, 1976 

IN exercise of the powers under the proviso to sub-section (2-A) of sec-
tion 3-A of the U. P. Sales Tax Act, 1948 (U. P. Act no XV of 1948), read 
irith section 21 of the U. P. General Clauses Act, 1904 (U. P. Act no. I of 
1904) . the Governor is pleased— 

to supersede, with effect from the date of publication of this notification In the Gazette, Government notification no. ST-2-6624/X-1012-1972, dated December 1, 1973; and 

to order that, with effect from the aforesaid date, the turnover in respect 
of the goods mentioned in Column II of the List below shall be liable to tax 
at the point of sale by the manufacturer or importer thereof at the reduced 
rate specified against each in column III of the said List :— 

LIST 

25 

Serial No 	Discription of goods 	
Rate of Tax 

1 	 2 

I. Polyester Staple fibre 
2 per cent Naptha 
5 per cent Exercise Books 

_ 	 5 per cent 
Na ST-2-3007/X-1035 (20) -74 

_ 

Dated Lucknow, May 20, 1976 

IN exercise of the powers under section 4-B of the U. P. Sales Tax Act, 
1948 (U. P. Act no., XV of 1948) , the Governor is plelased to order that, 

, with effect from. the 'date of publication of this notification in the 
Gazed& and subject to the conditions and resrictioris specified in the aforesaid .section, 

no tax shall be payable on the sale to or, as the case may be, purchase by 
a dealer holding a recognition certificate in respect of raw materials required 

. by him for use in the' manufacture or packing of exercise books manufactured by him. 

Lv exercise 
Act, 1948 (U. P. 
effect front the 
under the said 
the— 

No. ST-2-9251/X-5 (1) -73 

Dated Lucknow, May 20, 1976 

of the powers under section 4 of the Uttar Pradesh Sales Tax 
Act no. XV of 1948), the Governor is pleased to order that, with 
date of publication of this notification in the Gazette, no tax Act shall be payable by a dealer on his sales of any goods ko 

(I) Government of Bhutan, or 

His Majesty the King of Bhutan 
Royal Family, or - 

Indian Military Training Team, Bina 
Bhutan, or an or the Dantak Project, 

or a member of the Bhutan 

(4) the Representative of India in Bhutan or the Border Roads 
Organisation, or 	 • 

(5) any dealer or private individual resident in Bhutan, 
r their use or for resale in Bhutan, on the condition that the dealer fur-

ishes to the assessing authority a certificate, duly signed and certified under 
)e official seal by the authorities mentioned below, to the effect that the -
rids are for export to and use in Bhutan and have actually entered into the rritories of Bhutan :— 

. 	 . 
(1) in the case of sales made to the Government of Bhutan, His 

Majesty the King of Bhutan or to a member of the Bhutan Royal fulfil, 



26 	7kw 	TrAt, 2 0 lit 1975 • 

by a Commissioner, Deputy Commissioner or Sub-Divisional Officer of 
Government of Bhutan, or by the Director, State Trading Corporation:: 
of Bhutan, or by the Chief Engineer, Public Works Department, Govern : merit of Bhutan, or by the Finance Minister, Government of Bhutan ; 

in the case of sales made to Dantak Project, by the Chief Engitieeie Dantak or any officer specifically nominated by him for this purpose ; 

(3) in the case of sales made to Indian Military Training Team, by., 
the Commandant, IM1RAT', or any other officer specifically norninated: 
by him for this purpose ; and 

in respect of any other sales, by the Finance Minister, Government..., 
Bhutan, or by the Sub•Divisional Officer, Government of Bhutan, Phunt--
shofing, or by an officer of the•office of the Representative of India iri1:1 
Bhutan nominated by the said Representative. 

No. ST-2-870/X—I1 (11)-75 • 

Dated Lucknow, May 20, 1976 
IN exercise of the powers under clause (b) of section 4 of the U. P. Sales 

Tax Act, 1948 (U. P. Act no. XV of 1948), the Governor is pleased to tORder..H1: that, with effect from April 1, 1976, no .tax under the said Act shall be payable 
for a period of four years on the sale of any goods by Tibefan Women's Centrej., 
Daiwa Dun. 

No. ST-II-2959/X-11 (33)-73 

Dated Lucknow, May 20, 1976 

IN exercise of the powers under clause (b) of section 4 of the U. P. Salei'Ll Tax Act., 1948 (U. P. Act no. XV of 1948), the Governor is pleased to order'.::': that, with effect from June 1, 1976, no tax shall be payable on the turnover•of1(.11 sales of Bardana (packing material) and containers by a person who deals exL 
elusively in goods declared tax-free under the afdresaid Act, but sells packing,•fi. 
materials and containers only as insidental to his main business. - 

No. ST-II-2960/X-900 (30) -70 

Dated Luck.now, May 20, 1976 
IN exercise of the powers under clause (b) of section 4 of the 	P. 

Tax Ao:. 1948 (U. P. Act no. XV of 1918), the Governor is pleased to order,St 
that. with effect frotn June 1, 1976, no tax under the said Act shall. be  payable jT 
on the sale of 'Water Mark Paper" by Government Treasuries and Sub-Trea+.• . sillies in Uttar Pradesh. 

	r ?r, 

T,qtx 
fafl-  9-Na 

ito7•707,0fro —70 it 0 3'2 T'TO (fr4T0)--1976-550 (itTe 


	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012
	00000013
	00000014
	00000015
	00000016
	00000017
	00000018
	00000019
	00000020
	00000021
	00000022
	00000023
	00000024
	00000025
	00000026

